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 A Brass Band is a musical ensemble 
comprising a standardized range of brass 

and percussion instruments.  



 The Loyola Brass Band Club is an eminent 
club that calls for this purpose. Students 
develop their skills by learning the 
traditional wind instruments, such as 
trumpets and bass.  

 Loyola Brass band has a tradition of playing 
music in various occasions such as Union 
inauguration day, Sports Day, Graduation 
day etc. and we try to develop the best 
percussionist. 



 One of the main advantages of the brass 
band is that it is portable and capable of 
playing at any time and anywhere, even on 
the March.  

 Marching and outdoor functions have been 
the preserve of the brass band for well over 
a century. Many brass bands are closely 
woven into the local community, performing 
outdoor civic duties throughout the year 

 



 Soprano cornet 

 Cornets 

 Flugelhorn 

 Tenor horns 

  Baritone horns 

 Tenor trombones 

  Bass trombone  

  Euphoniums 

  Tubas 

  Trumpets 

  percussion players 



 Generally, the chief guest are received by 
playing the VIP call, where the members hit 
the high notes on their instruments. 

  

 The members march by playing various 
numbers accompanied by the chief guest till 
the final point. Finally our team concludes the 
event with the national anthem(if necessary).  



 BRASS BAND INAUGURATION 

 STUDENTS UNION INAUGURATION  

 INDEPENDENCE DAY CELEBRATION 

 OVATIONS  

 REPUBLIC DAY 

 GRADUATION DAY 

 SPORTS DAY (SHIFT - I) 

 SPORTS DAY (SHIFT - II) 

 



 We inaugurated the club on 03-07-2015 at 
Brass Band room and the office bearers were 
introduced. 



S.NO DESIGNATION NAME DEPARTMENT 

1 PRESIDENT PIGGOT MATHEMATICS 

2 VICE PRESIDENT JEROME ADV ZOOLOGY 

3 SECRETARY RAMAKRISHNAN MATHEMATICS 

4 JOINT SECRETARY SUNIL CHEMISTRY 

5 COORDINATOR AGHIL MATHEMATICS 

6 DIRECTOR SATHISH KUMAR  B.COM 
















